
 15-18092-01 HERBICIDE, INSECTICIDES AND FERTILIZERS

Mystic Blue Spray Pattern 

Indicator 
60 GALLON 15.35$     22.00$    21.14$     15.91$     31.95$      39.94$   

Arena Insecticide 0.25 G, 

EPA reg. 59639-152
5

40 OZ. 

BOTTLE
49.50$     546.75$  NO BID 546.76$   546.75$    NO BID

Blindside Herbicide, EPA 

reg. 279-3411
115

3 OZ. 

BOTTLE
102.50$    87.50$    NO BID 99.00$     103.45$    

 Larger 

Size 

Extinguish Fire Ant Bait, 

EPA reg. 2724-496
500 LBS. 6.10$       NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.03$        6.88$     

Strike Three Herbicide, EPA 

reg.14774-2
70 GAL. NO BID 26.00$    26.12$     23.86$     21.65$      NO BID

Katana Herbicide, EPA reg. 

71512-12-2217
30

3 OZ. 

BOTTLE
149.50$    NO BID NO BID 168.00$   184.50$    NO BID

Pendulum 3.3 EC Herbicide, 

EPA reg. 241-341
6 GAL. 33.56$     33.20$    29.68$     27.20$      Larger Size 

 Larger 

Size 

24-2-11 Fertilizer w/9.02% 

slow release nitrogen
64,800 LBS. NO BID 0.35$      NO BID 0.36$       NO BID NO BID

Demon Max Insecticide, 

EPA reg. 100-1218
4

16 OZ 

BOTTLES
16.24$     NO BID NO BID 18.85$     26.44$      17.96$   

Helena Chemical Harrell's Red River Specialties John Deere Landscapes

64.96$          

1,320.00$      

2,733.75$      

10,062.50$    

NO BID

1,820.00$      

NO BID

199.20$        

22,680.00$    

NO BID

954.60$        

2,733.80$      

921.00$        

247.50$        

11,787.50$    

3,050.00$      

NO BID

4,485.00$      

201.36$        

NO BID

1,268.40$   

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1,828.40$   

NO BID

Winfield

1,917.00$      

2,733.75$      

11,896.75$    

3,515.00$      

DESCRIPTION QTY.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

23,587.20$    

75.40$          

11,385.00$    

NO BID

1,670.20$      

5,040.00$      

163.20$        178.08$      

NO BID

NO BID

1,515.50$      

5,535.00$      

250.20$        

NO BID

105.76$        

NO BID

NO BID

257.25$        

NO BID

71.84$          

Univar USA Inc.

2,396.40$     

NO BID

4,233.35$     

3,440.00$     



 15-18092-01 HERBICIDE, INSECTICIDES AND FERTILIZERS

Helena Chemical Harrell's Red River Specialties John Deere Landscapes

1,320.00$      954.60$        921.00$        1,268.40$   

Winfield

1,917.00$      

DESCRIPTION QTY.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE
Univar USA Inc.

2,396.40$     
14-14-14 Osmotcote 

Fertilizer 3-4 Month
600 LBS. NO BID 0.71$      NO BID 0.56$       1.35$        NO BID

Stockosorb Water Retaining 

Polymer, EPA reg. 1476151
100 LBS. 2.08$       NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.00$        NO BID

Talstar Insecticide, EPA reg. 

279-9552
700 LBS. 0.64$       NO BID 0.58$       1.01$       0.92$        0.91$     

Ranger Pro Herbicide, EPA reg. 524-51760 GAL. 14.19$     16.00$    15.29$     19.60$     16.20$      NO BID

Acephate 97 UP, EPA reg. 70506-81300 LBS. 8.60$       8.30$      NO BID 9.00$       10.27$      9.10$     

40-0-0 Urea Fertilizer 3750 LBS. NO BID 0.30$      NO BID 0.32$       NO BID NO BID

19-0-19 w/Pre-Emergence 

Herbicide
16,000 LBS. NO BID 0.34$      NO BID 0.46$       NO BID NO BID

Wisdom Insecticide Liquid, 

EPA reg. 5481-519
5 GAL. 26.35$     34.25$    NO BID 31.00$     28.23$      29.58$   

Wisdom Insecticide 

Granular, EPA reg. 5481-

521 

250 LBS. 0.62$       NO BID NO BID 0.60$       0.66$        0.67$     

NO BID

NO BID

208.00$        

448.00$        

851.40$        

11,180.00$    10,790.00$    

426.00$        

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

406.00$      

960.00$        917.40$      1,176.00$      

11,700.00$    

336.60$        

NO BID

707.70$        

NO BID

810.00$        

700.00$        

641.90$        

972.00$        

13,351.00$    

NO BID1,188.75$      NO BID1,125.00$      NO BID

155.00$        

141.15$        155.00$        NO BID171.25$        131.75$        

165.00$        149.25$        NO BIDNO BID

NO BID7,344.00$      NO BID5,448.00$      

NO BID

NO BID

147.90$        

167.50$        

NO BID

NO BID

637.00$        

NO BID

11,830.00$    
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Helena Chemical Harrell's Red River Specialties John Deere Landscapes

1,320.00$      954.60$        921.00$        1,268.40$   

Winfield

1,917.00$      

DESCRIPTION QTY.
UNIT OF 

MEASURE
Univar USA Inc.

2,396.40$     

 $   9,712.11  $ 50,105.50  $    406.00  $      649.05  $   4,249.25  $               -   


